
Road F from Road 17 to Road 19

Length:  10320 Feet or 1.95 Mile(s)

Width:  16 Feet     (Approx. 18465 S.Y. including radius and driveway work)

Type: ODOT Spec 823 

Ref. # Item Quantity Unit Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 407 1850 Gal Bituminous Tack Coat applied at 0.05 gallons per square yard  $             3.00  $        5,550.00  $          2.50  $     4,625.00  $          4.00  $       7,400.00 

2 823 257 C.Y.

Asphalt intermediate course PG 64-22, Type 1 (823) applied, 

spread and compacted at the average depth of 0.5 inches  $         210.00  $      53,970.00  $      185.00  $   47,545.00  $      210.00  $     53,970.00 

3 823 642 C.Y.

Asphalt concrete surface course PG 64-22, Type 1 (823) applied, 

spread and compacted at the average depth of 1.25 inches  $         210.00  $    134,820.00  $      195.00  $ 125,190.00  $      210.00  $   134,820.00 

4 254 236 S.Y. Pavement Planing ( 20' milled including radius)  $           20.00  $        4,720.00  $        23.00  $     5,428.00  $          6.00  $       1,416.00 

5 614 1 L.S. Maintaining Traffic  $      3,000.00  $        3,000.00  $   2,400.00  $     2,400.00  $   2,500.00  $       2,500.00 

6 624 1 L.S. Mobilization  $      2,500.00  $        2,500.00  $   1,300.00  $     1,300.00  $   2,500.00  $       2,500.00 

7 103.05 1 L.S. Contract Performance & Payment Bond  $      1,030.00  $        1,030.00  $      875.00  $        875.00  $   1,250.00  $       1,250.00 

Estimate Total 205,590.00$     $ 187,363.00  $   203,856.00  NO BID 

Road 10A from SR 18 to SR 281

Length:  11365 Feet or 2.15 Mile(s)

Width:  18 Feet     (Approx. 22865 S.Y. including radius and driveway work)

Type: ODOT Spec 823 

Ref. # Item Quantity Unit Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 407 2290 Gal Bituminous Tack Coat applied at 0.05 gallons per square yard  $             3.00  $        6,870.00  $          2.50  $     5,725.00  $          4.00  $       9,160.00 

2 823 318 C.Y.

Asphalt intermediate course PG 64-22, Type 1 (823) applied, 

spread and compacted at the average depth of 0.5 inches  $         210.00  $      66,780.00  $      179.00  $   56,922.00  $      210.00  $     66,780.00 

3 823 794 C.Y.

Asphalt concrete surface course PG 64-22, Type 1 (823) applied, 

spread and compacted at the average depth of 1.25 inches  $         210.00  $    166,740.00  $      186.00  $ 147,684.00  $      210.00  $   166,740.00 

4 254 450 S.Y. Pavement Planing ( 20' milled including raidus)  $           20.00  $        9,000.00  $        11.50  $     5,175.00  $          6.00  $       2,700.00 

5 614 1 L.S. Maintaining Traffic  $      3,000.00  $        3,000.00  $   2,000.00  $     2,000.00  $   2,500.00  $       2,500.00 

6 624 1 L.S. Mobilization  $      2,500.00  $        2,500.00  $   1,300.00  $     1,300.00  $   2,500.00  $       2,500.00 

7 103.05 1 L.S. Contract Performance & Payment Bond  $      1,700.00  $        1,280.00  $   1,025.00  $     1,025.00  $   1,250.00  $       1,250.00 

Estimate Total 256,170.00$     $ 219,831.00  $   251,630.00  NO BID 

Road S from SR 108 to Road 13

Length:  5255 Feet or 1 Mile(s)

Width:  18 Feet     (Approx. 10595 S.Y. including radius and driveway work)

Type: ODOT Spec 823 

Ref. # Item Quantity Unit Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 407 1060 Gal Bituminous Tack Coat applied at 0.05 gallons per square yard  $             3.00  $        3,180.00  $          2.50  $     2,650.00  $          4.00  $       4,240.00 

2 823 148 C.Y.

Asphalt intermediate course PG 64-22, Type 1 (823) applied, 

spread and compacted at the average depth of 0.5 inches  $         210.00  $      31,080.00  $      188.00  $   27,824.00  $      210.00  $     31,080.00 

3 823 368 C.Y.

Asphalt concrete surface course PG 64-22, Type 1 (823) applied, 

spread and compacted at the average depth of 1.25 inches  $         210.00  $      77,280.00  $      188.00  $   69,184.00  $      210.00  $     77,280.00 

4 254 220 S.Y. Pavement Planing ( 20' milled including radius)  $           20.00  $        4,400.00  $        10.50  $     2,310.00  $          6.00  $       1,320.00 

5 614 1 L.S. Maintaining Traffic  $      3,000.00  $        3,000.00  $   1,350.00  $     1,350.00  $   2,500.00  $       2,500.00 

6 624 1 L.S. Mobilization  $      2,500.00  $        2,500.00  $   1,000.00  $     1,000.00  $   2,500.00  $       2,500.00 

7 103.05 1 L.S. Contract Performance & Payment Bond  $         610.00  $           610.00  $      500.00  $        500.00  $   1,250.00  $       1,250.00 

Estimate Total 122,050.00$     $ 104,818.00  $   120,170.00  NO BID 

Geddis Paving

Geddis Paving

Geddis Paving

Henry W Bergman

Henry W Bergman

Henry W Bergman

Bid Tab

Township Project Name
3.10.25

Engineer's Estimate Gerken Paving

Engineer's Estimate Gerken Paving

Engineer's Estimate Gerken Paving



Road 24 from US 6 to Road S

Length:  5215 Feet or 0.99 Mile(s)

Width:  20 Feet     (Approx. 11665 S.Y. including radius and driveway work)

Type: ODOT Spec 823 

Ref. # Item Quantity Unit Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 407 1170 Gal Bituminous Tack Coat applied at 0.05 gallons per square yard  $             3.00  $        3,510.00  $          2.50  $     2,925.00  $          4.00  $       4,680.00 

2 823 162 C.Y.

Asphalt intermediate course PG 64-22, Type 1 (823) applied, 

spread and compacted at the average depth of 1.5 inches  $         210.00  $      34,020.00  $      184.00  $   29,808.00  $      210.00  $     34,020.00 

3 823 405

Asphalt concrete surface course PG 64-22, Type 1 (823) applied, 

spread and compacted at the average depth of 1.5 inches  $         210.00  $      85,050.00  $      191.00  $   77,355.00  $      210.00  $     85,050.00 

4 254 220 S.Y.

Pavement Planing- 1.5" average depth entire street including bike 

lane  $           20.00  $        4,400.00  $        11.75  $     2,585.00  $          6.00  $       1,320.00 

5 614 1 L.S. Maintaining Traffic  $      3,000.00  $        3,000.00  $   2,250.00  $     2,250.00  $   2,500.00  $       2,500.00 

6 624 1 L.S. Mobilization  $      2,500.00  $        2,500.00  $   1,300.00  $     1,300.00  $   2,500.00  $       2,500.00 

7 103.05 1 L.S. Contract Performance & Payment Bond  $         670.00  $           670.00  $      525.00  $        525.00  $   1,250.00  $       1,250.00 

Estimate Total 133,150.00$     $ 116,748.00  $   131,320.00  NO BID 

Road R from SR 108 to Oakwood

Length:  3540 Feet or 0.67 Mile(s)

Width:  20 Feet     (Approx. 7960 S.Y. including radius and driveway work)

Type: ODOT Spec 823 with Various Pavement Repairs 

Ref. # Item Quantity Unit Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 202 4 EA Remove & Relocate Mailbox/Paperbox  $         375.00  $        1,500.00  $      350.00  $     1,400.00  $      250.00  $       1,000.00 

2 203 109 CY

Excavation (2' Widening north side, 5" depth, 100% material layed 

over as additional embankment, not to be used in residential yards 

and Mailbox Turnout)  $           70.00  $        7,630.00  $        57.75  $     6,294.75  $        55.00  $       5,995.00 

3 204 785 SY Subgrade Compaction  $             1.00  $           785.00  $          0.60  $        471.00  $          1.00  $          785.00 

4 301 109 CY

Bituminous Aggregate Base, (5" average compacted depth, 

includes 407 tack coat on vertical face)  $         200.00  $      21,800.00  $      205.00  $   22,345.00  $      185.00  $     20,165.00 

5 407 800 Gal Bituminous Tack Coat applied at 0.05 gallons per square yard  $             3.00  $        2,400.00  $          2.50  $     2,000.00  $          4.00  $       3,200.00 

6 823 111 C.Y.

Asphalt intermediate course PG 64-22, Type 1 (823) applied, 

spread and compacted at the average depth of 0.5 inches  $         210.00  $      23,310.00  $      191.00  $   21,201.00  $      210.00  $     23,310.00 

7 823 276 C.Y.

Asphalt concrete surface course PG 64-22, Type 1 (823) applied, 

spread and compacted at the average depth of 1.25 inches  $         210.00  $      57,960.00  $      193.00  $   53,268.00  $      210.00  $     57,960.00 

8 254 80 S.Y. Pavement Planing (20' milled including radius)  $           20.00  $        1,600.00  $        35.25  $     2,820.00  $          6.00  $          480.00 

9 614 1 L.S. Maintaining Traffic  $      2,000.00  $        2,000.00  $   1,450.00  $     1,450.00  $   2,500.00  $       2,500.00 

10 624 1 L.S. Mobilization  $      4,000.00  $        4,000.00  $   2,350.00  $     2,350.00  $   2,500.00  $       2,500.00 

11 103.05 1 L.S. Contract Performance & Payment Bond  $         615.00  $           615.00  $      525.00  $        525.00  $   1,250.00  $       1,250.00 

Estimate Total 123,600.00$     $ 114,124.75  $   119,145.00  NO BID 

Geddis Paving

Geddis Paving

Henry W Bergman

Henry W BergmanEngineer's Estimate

Engineer's Estimate Gerken Paving

Gerken Paving



Napoleon Twp- Road R1 from US 6 to 18

Length:  4015 Feet or 0.76 Mile(s)

Width:  17 Feet     (Approx. 7655 S.Y. including radius and driveway work)

Type: ODOT Spec 823 with Various Pavement Repairs 

Ref. # Item Quantity Unit Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 202 4 EA Remove & Relocate Mailbox/Paperbox $375.00 $1,500.00  $      350.00  $     1,400.00  $      250.00  $       1,000.00 

2 203 465 CY

Excavation (7.5' Widening 7.5 feet on south side and Mailbox 

Turnout) $70.00 $32,550.00  $        27.00  $   12,555.00  $        35.00  $     16,275.00 

3 204 3345 SY Subgrade Compaction $1.50 $5,017.50  $          0.40  $     1,338.00  $          1.00  $       3,345.00 

4 301 465 CY

Bituminous Aggregate Base, (5" average compacted depth, 

includes 407 tack coat on vertical face) $200.00 $93,000.00  $      165.00  $   76,725.00  $      185.00  $     86,025.00 

5 407 770 Gal Bituminous Tack Coat applied at 0.05 gallons per square yard $3.00 $2,310.00  $          2.50  $     1,925.00  $          4.00  $       3,080.00 

6 823 106 C.Y.

Asphalt intermediate course PG 64-22, Type 1 (823) applied, 

spread and compacted at the average depth of 0.5 inches $210.00 $22,260.00  $      193.00  $   20,458.00  $      210.00  $     22,260.00 

7 823 266 C.Y.

Asphalt concrete surface course PG 64-22, Type 1 (823) applied, 

spread and compacted at the average depth of 1.25 inches $210.00 $55,860.00  $      200.00  $   53,200.00  $      210.00  $     55,860.00 

8 617 75 CY

Stabilized crushed aggregate berm in place and compacted at the 

average depth of 2 inches $95.00 $7,125.00  $      110.00  $     8,250.00  $        75.00  $       5,625.00 

9 254 140 S.Y. Pavement Planing (20' milled including radius) $25.00 $3,500.00  $        31.35  $     4,389.00  $          6.00  $          840.00 

10 614 1 L.S. Maintaining Traffic $4,000.00 $4,000.00  $   2,200.00  $     2,200.00  $   2,500.00  $       2,500.00 

11 624 1 L.S. Mobilization $6,000.00 $6,000.00  $   2,850.00  $     2,850.00  $   2,500.00  $       2,500.00 

12 103.05 1 L.S. Contract Performance & Payment Bond $1,387.50 $1,387.50  $      925.00  $        925.00  $   1,250.00  $       1,250.00 

13 209 4015 Feet Linear Grading $3.00 $12,045.00  $          1.35  $     5,420.25  $          0.50  $       2,007.50 

14 659 2200 S.Y. Seeding and Mulching $2.00 $4,400.00  $          1.40  $     3,080.00  $          0.50  $       1,100.00 

15 659 6 M. Gal Water $10.00 $60.00  $          1.00  $            6.00  $          1.00  $              6.00 

16 659 0.4 Ton Commercial Feritlizer $600.00 $240.00  $      850.00  $        340.00  $   2,000.00  $          800.00 

Estimate Total $251,255.00  $ 195,061.25  $   204,473.50  NO BID 

Henry County Fairgrounds

Paved Area:  Approx. 8382 S.Y.

Width:  Varies

Type: ODOT Spec 823 

Ref. # Item Quantity Unit Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 407 406 Gal Bituminous Tack Coat applied at 0.05 gallons per square yard  $             3.00  $        1,218.00  $          2.50  $     1,015.00  $          4.00  $       1,624.00  $          3.00  $       1,218.00 

2 823 26 C.Y.

Asphalt intermediate course PG 64-22, Type 1 (823) applied, 

spread and compacted at the average depth of 1.5 inches  $         250.00  $        6,500.00  $      300.00  $     7,800.00  $      210.00  $       5,460.00  $      275.00  $       7,150.00 

3 823 379 C.Y.

Asphalt concrete surface course PG 64-22, Type 1 (823) applied, 

spread and compacted at the average depth of 1.5 inches  $         250.00  $      94,750.00  $      195.00  $   73,905.00  $      210.00  $     79,590.00  $      252.00  $     95,508.00 

4 254 607 S.Y. Pavement Planing 3" depth (includes 12' wide stone drive/ road)  $             4.00  $        2,428.00  $          7.25  $     4,400.75  $          6.00  $       3,642.00  $          4.85  $       2,943.95 

5 614 1 L.S. Maintaining Traffic  $      2,000.00  $        2,000.00  $   1,500.00  $     1,500.00  $   2,500.00  $       2,500.00  $   1,000.00  $       1,000.00 

6 624 1 L.S. Mobilization  $      7,500.00  $        7,500.00  $   3,800.00  $     3,800.00  $   2,500.00  $       2,500.00  $   2,550.00  $       2,550.00 

7 103.05 1 L.S. Contract Performance & Payment Bond  $         766.50  $           766.50  $      625.00  $        625.00  $   1,250.00  $       1,250.00  $      750.00  $          750.00 

8 253 55 C.Y.

Pavement Repair and Widening - After Removal of Any Soft Areas 

Found After Planing (excavate area and place 6" of 304 aggregate 

and compact in place)  $         350.00  $      19,250.00  $      335.00  $   18,425.00  $      100.00  $       5,500.00  $      130.00  $       7,150.00 

9 254 7775 S.Y. Pavement Planing 1.5" depth  $             2.50  $      19,437.50  $          2.50  $   19,437.50  $          6.00  $     46,650.00  $          4.00  $     31,100.00 

Estimate Total 153,850.00$     $ 130,908.25  $   148,716.00  $   149,369.95 

Geddis Paving

Geddis PavingHenry W Bergman

Henry W BergmanEngineer's Estimate Gerken Paving

Gerken PavingEngineer's Estimate



ALTERNATE- HC Fairgrounds:Parking Areas

Paved Area:  Approx. 3298 S.Y.

Width:  Varies

Type: ODOT Spec 823 

Ref. # Item Quantity Unit Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 407 165 Gal Bituminous Tack Coat applied at 0.05 gallons per square yard  $             3.00  $           495.00  $          2.50  $        412.50  $          4.00  $          660.00  $          3.00  $          495.00 

2 823 138 C.Y.

Asphalt concrete surface course PG 64-22, Type 1 (823) applied, 

spread and compacted at the average depth of 1.5 inches  $         250.00  $      34,500.00  $      250.00  $   34,500.00  $      210.00  $     28,980.00  $      252.00  $     34,776.00 

3 254 3298 S.Y. Pavement Planing 1.5" depth  $             2.50  $        8,245.00  $          5.00  $   16,490.00  $          3.25  $     10,718.50  $          4.00  $     13,192.00 

Estimate Total 43,240.00$       $   51,402.50  $     40,358.50  $     48,463.00 

Total Entire Bid- Base Bid

Total Entire Bid with Alternate

149,369.95$                  

197,832.95$                  

NOT CONSIDERED

BID INCOMPLETE

1,219,669.00$               

Geddis Paving

1,120,256.75$             

Henry W Bergman

1,179,310.50$               

Engineer's Estimate Gerken Paving

1,288,905.00$                   

1,245,665.00$                   1,068,854.25$             


